MONROE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
November 5, 2025

The regular meeting of the Monroe County Board of Commissioners was held on Wednesday,
November 5, 2025, in the Commissioners’ Public Meeting Room at the Monroe County Administrative Center
with the following present: Chairman John D. Christy, Vice-Chairman David C. Parker, Commissioner Sharon S.
Laverdure, Solicitor Deborah L. Huffman, Chief Clerk/Administrator Robert J. Gress and Administrative Secretary
Cindy Cook.

Chairman Christy opened the meeting at 9:30 a.m. with a moment of silence followed by the
pledge of allegiance to the flag.

Chairman Christy asked if there was any public comment on agenda items.

Deborah Storman, Chief Assessor, read the following statement regarding agenda number 8 —
Information Technology and Services. On behalf of various members of the GIS Committee, | would respectfully
request the Commissioners table the vote on the contract with Michael Baker International for $25,000.00, until
all members of the committee have had an opportunity to review the contract and determine how it relates to
each individual user, and to determine if it is actually necessary to pay for these services, some of which are
already provided by county employees.

Lauren Butler, a GIS analyst, stated the county is very overdue for having an upgrade to ARC GIS
Pro. We are behind other counties, and it is a good investment.

Patricia Clancy, Director of Information Technology and Services stated the IT department are
responsible for accounts, permissions and cybersecurity to protect the county network under their contract with
the county. Ms. Clancy requested the contract with Michael Baker International because the IT department
does not have enough training to support this particular system. Ms. Clancy stated the account manager with
Michael Baker International was previously our account manager at Esri. Ms. Clancy stated this person is
familiar with our environment and noted the contract is a cafeteria style plan which can be used to design the
system to meet our needs and assist with the training.

Commissioner Christy reiterated the contract is a cafeteria style plan and the governance
committee can decide the best way to spend the money.

Commissioner Laverdure asked what the term of the contract is, Patricia Clancy stated one year.

Jennifer Mercereau, Penn State Extension, Client Relationship Manager gave an update on a few
webinars that will be coming up. Ms. Mercereau stated to find out more information on the webinars and other
programs follow the Penn State Extension Facebook page at Penn State Extension of Monroe County or go to
extension.psu.edu.

Nicole McGeehan, Penn State Extension Educator, Food Safety & Quality/Health & Wellness
provided an update on the programming she is providing. Ms. McGeehan highlighted the food safety programs
as well as food preparation programs that are being offered. Facebook page is Penn State Extension Food and
Health and the Instagram is @psuextensionfood.

M-2025-299 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve the minutes of October 15, 2025, Commissioners’ Meeting.

M-2025-300 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to amend Motion 2025-278 dated 10/01/2025 to reflect revised Memorandum of Understanding
between Monroe County Victim Services and Women’s Resources of Monroe County DBA Safe Monroe.

M-2025-301 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded Commissioner Laverdure and carried to
ratify October 21, 2025, opening of the following bids for goods and services for 2026:
a. Bailiff, Correctional Officer & Deputy Sheriff Uniforms:
i. Moritz Embroidery Works - $6,112.50 (select items) — no bid security received
ii. Starr Uniform Center - $234,184.98 — 10% bond
b. Fuel Oil:



i. Liberty Discount Fuel - $.58 per gallon markup — no bid security required
ii. Stiff Oil Co. - .53 per gallon markup — no bid security required
c. Inmate Uniforms and Supplies:
i. Angielyns Collections - $49,470.00 (select items) — 10% cashier’s check
ii. Bob Barker Company Inc. - $122,554.33 — 10% bond
d. Janitorial Supplies:
i. Staples Contract & Commercial LLC - $204,164.84 — 10% bond
ii. Pyramid School Products - $75,320.06 — 10% bond
iii. W.B. Mason Company - $177,301.75 — 10% bond
iv. PA Paper & Supply - $162,738.91 - $20,000.00 bond
v. Central Poly Bag - $60,714.50 (select items) — 10% bond
vi. Brighter Days & Nights, Inc - $338,015.00 — 10% bond
vii. Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC - $376,863.97 — no bid security received (2 corporate checks
totaling $40,000.00)
viii. United Sales USA Corp. - $127,229.20 — 10% cashier’s check
ix. Office Basics, Inc. - $164,276.70 — 10% bond, no proposal page received
e. Office Supplies & Toner:
i. W.B. Mason Company - $241,599.15 (total bid) — 10% bond
ii. Office Basics, Inc. - $188,657.40 (total bid) — 10% bond, no proposal page received
iii. Staples Contract & Commercial LLC - $280,396.52 — 10% bond
iv. GCS Imaging, Inc. - $182,754.35 (toner only) — no bid security received
v. Innovative Printing Systems, Inc - $141,367.80 (toner only)- 10% bond
f. Propane:
i. Modern Gas - S.71 per gallon over market (fluctuating price only) — no bid security
required
ii. Heller's Gas - $1.37 per gallon (fixed price only) — no bid security required
g. Snow Removal:
Public Safety Center
i. Primrose Landscaping, LLC — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing — $150.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,960.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $185.00 per hour
(4) Sodium Chloride (rock salt) - $365.00 per ton
(5) Cinders-$60.00 per ton
(6) Clear and salt all walkways - $200.00 per hour
ii. E.F.Possinger & Sons Inc. — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing - $163.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,810.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $156.00 per hour
(4) Sodium Chloride (rock salt) - $390.00 per ton
(5) Cinders -$199.00 per ton
(6) Clear and salt all walkways - $249.00 per hour
iii. Strauser Natures Helpers — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing —$155.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,800.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $160.00 per hour
(4) Sodium Chloride - $325.00 per ton
(5) Cinders - $38.50 per ton
(6) Clear and salt all walkways - $65.00 per hour
Administrative Center:
i. Primrose Landscaping, LLC — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing —$150.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,960.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $185.00 per hour
ii. E.F.Possinger & Sons Inc. — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing - $163.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,810.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $156.00 per hour
iii. Strauser Natures Helpers — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing —$155.00 per hour
(2) Calcium Chloride - $1,800.00 per ton
(3) Snow Removal - $160.00 per hour
Former Jail Parking Lot:
i. Primrose Landscaping, LLC — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing —$150.00 per hour



(2) Sodium Chloride (rock salt) - $365.00 per ton
(3) Calcium Chloride - $1,960.00 per ton
(4) Cinders-$60.00 per ton
(5) Snow Removal - $185.00 per hour
ii. E.F.Possinger & Sons Inc. — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing - $163.00 per hour
(2) Sodium Chloride (rock salt) - $390.00 per ton
(3) Calcium Chloride - $1,810.00 per ton
(4) Cinders - $199.00 per ton
(5) Snow Removal - $156.00 per hour
iii. Strauser Natures Helpers — no bid security required
(1) Snowplowing — $155.00 per hour
(2) Sodium Chloride - $325.00 per ton
(3) Calcium Chloride - $1,800.00 per ton
(4) Cinders - $38.50 per ton
(5) Snow Removal - $160.00 per hour

M-2025-302 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to adopt the following proclamations and certificates:

Pocono Mountain Volunteer Fire Department — 100" Anniversary
Eric Bromley Hays — Eagle Scout

Proclamation

WHEREAS, the Pocono Mountain Volunteer Fire Department has proudly served the residents, businesses, and
visitors of the Borough of Mount Pocono and Paradise Township for 100 years, standing as a symbol of
dedication, courage, and community spirit since its founding in 1925; and

WHEREAS, throughout the past century, generations of volunteer firefighters have answered the call—day and
night, in all seasons—risking their own safety to protect lives, property, and the natural beauty of our region;
and

WHEREAS, the Department’s unwavering commitment extends beyond emergency response, encompassing
public education, community engagement, and countless hours of volunteer service that have strengthened the
fabric of our communities; and

WHEREAS, the men and women of the Pocono Mountain Volunteer Fire Department exemplify the proud
Pennsylvania tradition of volunteer firefighting—a tradition rooted in neighbor helping neighbor, selfless service,
and civic pride; and

WHEREAS, as we commemorate this milestone, we honor not only the current members but also the
generations who came before—those who built, sustained, and advanced the Department through changing
times, new technology, and growing communities; and

WHEREAS, the Pocono Mountain Volunteer Fire Department’s 100 years of service stand as a lasting testament
to the power of volunteerism and community partnership in protecting and improving the quality of life for all.

NOW, THEREFORE, the Monroe County Board of Commissioners hereby recognizes and congratulates the
Pocono Mountain Volunteer Fire Department on its 100th Anniversary and extends deep gratitude for a century
of outstanding service to the residents of Mount Pocono Borough and Paradise Township.

End of Proclamation

M-2025-303 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve the actions listed below:

1) Personnel:
a) Agenda:



FIRST NAME

NEW HIRES:
Camacho, Jaileen
Cloward, Kevin
Davis, Kareem
Dick, Aiden

Egry, Ryan

Fuller, Owen
Garrity, Mallory
Getz, Makenzie
Gonzalez, Randy
Guzman, Christian
Kennedy, Jaron
Kirkland, Messiah
Knight, Christian
Palmer, Fantaisha
Panico-DeVito, Alexandra
Patrick, Ruth
Perez, Noel
Reinhard. Jaytwaun
Sanders, Darryl
Soloman, Shania
Valentin, Jamaris
Rodriguez, Brianna
Johnson, Shaneeka
Spikes, Donnell
Peters, Jayden
Huntley, Linda
Korobka, Inna

SEPARATIONS:
Ryan, Charlayna
Thomas, Kenneth
Williams, Denzel
Anderson, Nnemdia
Jacob, Linda
Navarro, Madeline

CHANGES:
Budelmann, Eric
Donna, Barrett
Margaret Kober
Crawford, Keisha
Darab, Dwayne
Darab, Dwayne
Davis, Jermaine
Davis, Jermaine
Escourse, Dwight
Escourse, Dwight
Frank, Kristijan
Garcia, Justin
Johnson, Margo
Landan, James
Leonard, Stefan
Leonard, Stefan
Martynowicz, Arkadiusz
Martynowicz, Arkadiusz
Pearson, Tymeak
Pirela, Wilfredo
Werkheiser, Lance
Werkheiser, Lance
Wilsan, Stephen
Ferraro, Amanda
Atanasio, Jo-Ann
Germano, Brian
Acevedo, Jasmine
Hauser, Charlene
Hanson, Sean
Magee, Christopher
Harrison, Amber
Harrison, Amber
Frisbie, Sherr

MISCELLANEOUS:

DEPARTMENT:

CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
CareerLink
C&Y
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
District Attorney
District Justices
Public Defender

Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Domestic Relations
Domestic Relations
Probation - Adult

C&Y

Caonservation District
Controller
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Correctional Facility
Courts

District Attorney
District Attorney
District Justices
District Justices
Domestic Relations
Sheriff

Tax Claim

Tax Claim
Treasurer

POSITION:

Laborer
Labaorer
Labaorer
Labarer
Labarer
Labaorer
Labarer
Labarer
Laborer
Labarer
Labaorer
Laborer
Labarer
Labarer
Laborer
Labarer
Labarer
Laborer
Labarer
Labaorer
Laborer
33 CASW A1
co

10 Sergeant (Night)

22 Assistant District Attorney-PT

T Technician- Judge Levy
4 Application Intake

co

co

co

12 Enfrcemnt Spec Sr
7 Office Asst Sr

9 Probation Secretary

37 CASW 3
8 Enviro Educator

5 Accounts Receivable Officer

col
col
col
col
col
col
col
col
10 Sergeant
col
col
col
col
col
col
col
col
col
col
col

14 Exhibits & Quality Assurance Record Retention

5 Legal Secretary

17 Chief Prosecutor Appellate Section
10 Advanced Tech - Judge Levy
7 Technician - Judge Travagline

12 Enfrcemnt Spec Sr

6 Assistant Bailiff Supervisor
5 Accounting Tech

5 Accounting Tech

6 Asst Deputy Treasurer

STEP:

N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

N/A
N/A

N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

DATE:

11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
11/17/25
10/27/25

10/6/25
11/10/25

11/3/25
10/21/25
10/20/25

10/10/25
10/16/25
10/24/25
10/17/25
10/31/25
10/24/25

10/27/25
11/20-12/31/25
11/3/25
10/28-10/30/25
9/1-10/20/25
10/23/25
9/29-10113/25
10/14/25
10/9-10/20/25
10/21-11/7/25
10/4-11/7125
10/16-11/20/25
10/22/25
10/25-12/12/25
9/20-10/26/25
10/27/25
10/14-10/21/25
10/22-10/28/25
10/27-10/29/25
9/25-9/28/25

REASON:

Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
New Hire
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
New Hire

New Hire
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
New Hire

New Hire

New Hire
Rehire/Replacement
Rehire/Replacement
New Hire
Rehire/Replacement
New Hire/Replacement
Did Not Start

New Hire/Replacement
New Hire/Replacement
Change Start Date
Rehire

Non-Retained
Non-Retained
Non-Retained
Resigned
Resigned
Resigned

Promotion/Replacement
Extend LOA

Regrade

LOA

LOA

Shift Change - 3rd Shift
LOA

RTW Full Duty

Extend LOA

RTWW Mod Duty
Extend LOA

Modified Duty
Indefinite Suspension
Extend Modified Duty
Extend LOA

RTW Mod Duty

LOA

RTW Mod Duty

LOA

LOA

3/26/25 - 11/16/2! Extend Modified Duty

11/17/25
10/28-11/24/25
10/6-10/17/25
11/22/25
11/3/25
10/27/25
10/7/25
11/17/25
10/1/25
10/1/25

RTW Full Duty

Extend Mod Duty

LOA

Anniversary Step Increase
Regrade

Probation Complete
Probation Complete
Promotion/Replacement
Correct Promation Date
Probation Complete

11/29/25-1/9/26 LOA
9/18/25-3/17/26 Intermittent LOA

Approve the request from District Attorney Michael Mancuso to send the updated Chief Prosecutor Appellate Section (currently 14) to Archer for regrading.

Approve the request from Chief Assessor Deb Storman to extend OT for Susan Felker & Michelle Hasker - Shriweek through 12/31/25

b) Approve/Ratify Requests to work additional hours:
i) Sheriff’s Department for pay period ending 10/05/2025
(1) Deputies —20.25 hours
(2) Security — 85.75 hours
(3) Clerks—1.75 hours



ii) Commissioner’s Office for pay period ending 11/02/2025
(1) Peace Officer- 1 hour
iii) Commissioner’s Office for pay period ending 11/16/2025
(1) Administrative Staff — 2 hours
2) Electronic Financial Transactions (Ratify):
a) Vouchers Payable:
i) $2,702,995.13 dated 10/17/2025
ii) $653,514.90 dated 10/24/2025
iii) $1,192,938.90 dated 10/31/2025
b) Gross Payroll:
i) $1,567,804.66 for pay period ending 10/19/2025
¢) Healthcare Benefits Payments:
i) Highmark Blue Cross/Blue Shield:
(1) $84.02 dated 10/14/2025
(2) $66,402.62 dated 10/14/2025
(3) $188,618.04 dated 10/21/2025
(4) $20.60 dated 10/27/2025
(5) $123,364.19 dated 10/28/2025
ii) Geisinger:
(1) $63,615.21 dated 10/14/2025
(2) $4,444.53 dated 10/15/2025
(3) $65,952.36 dated 10/20/2025
(4) $63,782.22 dated 10/27/2025
iii) Dental Claims:
(1) $5,982.30 dated 10/14/2025
(2) $3,929.42 dated 10/17/2025
(3) $5,233.21 dated 10/24/2025
(4) $1,113.70 dated 10/29/2025
(5) $4,173.86 dated 10/31/2025
iv) Flexible Spending Account:
(1) $116.28 dated 10/14/2025
(2) $182.25 dated 10/14/2025
(3) $449.12 dated 10/17/2025
(4) $920.17 dated 10/24/2025
(5) $502.82 dated 10/31/2025

M-2025-304 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and
carried to approve/ratify the Travel Requests for the following: Area Agency on Aging, Commissioners,
Conservation District, Emergency Services, Juvenile Probation, Vector Control and Voter Registration.

M-2025-305 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve as requested by the Area Agency on Aging:

a) Reappoint the following to the Advisory Council with a new term to expire 09/13/2028:
i) Patricia Fretz
ii) Barbara Migliaccio

M-2025-306 Motion by Vice Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and carried
to approve the actions listed below:

a) Approve the Budget Adjustment Report dated 11/05/2025 totaling $70,736.00

b) Ratify the Budget Adjustment Report dated 11/05/2025 totaling $343,000.00

c) Ratify/Authorize chief clerk to advertise the following:

i) 2026 Meeting Dates and Holiday Schedule

ii) 2026 Budget Presentation and Adoption Dates

iii) Community Services Block Grant Requests for Funding Proposal applications 2026 Fiscal
Year

iv) Reschedule of Board of Prison Inspectors Meeting to 11/18/2025

d) Approve the use of Courthouse Square by Go Collaborative for the Tree Lighting to be held
on November 28, 2025, from 5:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m.

e) Accept Proposal with Walker Consultants to provide Professional Consulting Services for
Repairs to the County Parking Deck for the term 01/01/2026-12/31/2026 in the amount of
$88,155.00

f) Ratify the following Opioid Grants from the Opioid Settlement Funds consistent with the
uses allowed under the Opioid Settlement Agreement, Exhibit E:



i)
g)

h)

i)
i)
ii

iv

v)

Vi

Guardian Angel Recovery House, a Memorandum of Understanding and Agreement in the
amount of $10,000.00
Ratify a payment of $650.00 to WCP from the Opioid Settlement Funds to cover October
rent for a Law Enforcement Treatment Initiative (LETI) participant (TG)
Approve proposal from Richard Pierce Builders, Inc. in the amount of $9,100.00 to repair
slate on barn roof at the MCCF
Approve proposal from Richard Pierce to install missing Dutch lap siding and plywood in the
amount of $12,500.00 (lowest of 3 quotes)
Award the following bids for 2026 County Goods and Services:
Correctional Officer Uniforms:
(1) Starr Uniform Center - $118,015.15
Deputy Sheriff Uniforms:
(1) Starr Uniform Center - $73,215.23
) Bailiff Uniforms:
(1) Starr Uniform Center - $42,954.60
) Fuel Qil:
(1) Award bid to Stiff Qil Co, Fluctuating at .53 markup per gallon for Former Jail, MCCF,
MDJ Mancuso and Courthouse Generator
Inmate Uniforms and Supplies:
(1) Bob Barker Company, Inc. - $122,554.33
) Janitorial Supplies — Administrative Center:
(1) PA Paper & Supply - $46,240.25
(2) W.B. Mason - $10,451.85
(3) Central Poly Bag - $10,005.00
(4) Pyramid School Products - $18,116.52
(5) Brighter Days & Nites, Inc - $1,759.45
(6) Staples Contract & Commercial LLC - $7,233.15

vii) Janitorial Supplies — Correctional Facility:

(1) PA Paper & Supply - $23,346.02

(2) W.B. Mason -$12,346.34

(3) Central Poly Bag - $4,360.20

(4) Pyramid School Products - $13, 864.96

(5) Brighter Days & Nites, Inc - $91,626.82

(6) Staples Contract & Commercial - $13,307.58

viii) Office Supplies:

(1) W.B. Mason - $79,835.55

ix) Toner:

X)

(1) IPS Global - $141,367.80
Propane:
(1) Award bid to Heller’s Gas, Inc. $1.37 per gallon — fixed price for MCCF, Public Safety
Center and Monroe Sewage Treatment Plant

xi) Snow Removal:

j)
i)

i)

(1) Award bid to Strauser Natures Helpers for Admin. Center, Former Jail Lot and Public
Safety Center:
(a) Snowplowing - $155.00 per hour
(b) Calcium Chloride - $1,800.00 per ton
(c) Sodium Chloride (rock salt) - $325.00 per ton
(d) Cinders - $38.50 per ton
(e) Snow Removal - $160.00 per hour
(f) Clear and Salt all Walkways - $65.00 per hour (Public Safety Center Only)
Add the following Vendors to the County List of Approved Vendors:
District Attorney:
(1) Microtrace, LLC (Ratify)
(2) Devine Depositions, LLC (Ratify)
(3) Dawn til Dusk
Emergency Management:
(1) Chery Industrial, Inc.

iii) Public Defender:

(1) Arnaldo Lopez Rivera, M. Sc.

iv) Commissioners:

(1) AMZ Logistics LLC d/b/a Amz Housing Solutions

Chairman Christy explained the budget adjustment reports.



M-2025-307 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and
carried to approve the following actions as requested by the Conservation District:

a) Re-appoint the following to the Conservation District Board of Directors, and authorize
submittal of the nominations to the State Conservation Commission for concurrence:
i) Donna Foulk, Farmer Director with a new term to expire 12/31/ 2029
ii) Jason Smith, Farmer Director with a new term to expire 12/31/ 2029
iii) Sharon S. Laverdure, Commissioner Representative — 1/1/2026 to 12/31/2026

M-2025-308 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve the actions listed below as requested by the Fiscal/Grants Department:

a) Ratify Approval for the submission of the FY 2024-25 HAP/HSDF Non-Block Grant (NBG)
Report in the amount of:

HAP - S 66,028.00
HSDF- $ 93,507.00
Total- $ 159,535.00
b) Approve CSBG 2025 Funds for Sub-recipient Re-Allocation:
i) Safe Monroe — Returned Unspent Funds (518,219.00)
ii) Stroud Region Open Space & Rec Commission — Returned Unspent Funds -($2,000.00)
iii) CSS — Shepherd’s Maternity Home $1,640.00
iv) Pleasant Valley Ecumenical Network $2,550.00
v) Pocono Area Transitional Housing $7,466.00
vi) Pocono Services For Families and Children $8,563.00
Total Additional Admin Re-Allocation $20,219.00
c) Approve the 2025/2026 fiscal year budgets for Fund 850:
i) The Emergency Food Assistance Program (TEFAP) $97,790.00
ii) Emergency Solutions Grant (ESG) 2025-2027 no award at this time
iii) Victims of Crime Act (VOCA) $188,102.00

Total $285,892.00
d) Approve allocation of The Emergency Food Assistance Program (TEFAP) funds received by
Monroe County to the following food pantries:

i) Christian Awareness Ministries Ecumenical $2,000.00
ii) Bushkill Outreach, Inc. $3,000.00
iii) Pocono Mountain Ecumenical Hunger Ministry $5,000.00
iv) Pleasant Valley Ecumenical Network $5,000.00
v) Top of the Mountain Ecumenical $5,000.00
vi) The Salvation Army (Pantry) $5,000.00
Total $25,000.00

M-2025-309 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and
carried to table professional services proposal with Michael Baker International in amount of $25,000.00 for GIS
services for the period 11/5/2025 through 11/04/2026 until a meeting with the governance committee can be
held. Chairman Christy voted nay to the motion.

Vice-Chairman Parker stated he appreciated the Chief Assessor’s remarks and believes it is
reasonable to have a discussion with the governance committee before approving the contract. Vice-Chairman
Parker stated one thing he feels in his short time here is communication could be better. Commissioner
Laverdure spoke about the importance of having a discussion with the governance committee. Chairman Christy
stated the county is behind the eight ball with this and it will need to be addressed at the next meeting. Patricia
Clancy, Director of Information Technology and Services, spoke about the importance of the professional
services contract and the money is in the Information Technology and Services budget. Deborah Storman, Chief
Assessor, reiterated the assessment office is asking for a meeting of the governance committee to make sure
everyone is in agreement about the correct way to move forward.

M-2025-310 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Chairman Christy and carried to
approve the following actions as requested by the Monroe County Hospital Authority:

a) Reappoint the following to the board with a new term to expire 02/01/2030:
i) Commissioner Sharon S. Laverdure
ii) Robert Weseloh

M-2025-311 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and
carried to authorize John D. Christy to sign Bank Account Change Form with 3™ party company Govolutions due
to routing number change with ESSA bank to CNB bank as requested by Pre-Trial Services.



M-2025-312 Motion by Vice-Chairman Parker, seconded by Commissioner Laverdure and
carried to approve the actions listed below as requested by the Pocono Mountains Regional Airport:

a) Approve county match and contribution in the amount of $296,333.00 (5% match totaling
$148,166.50 and $148,166.50 county contribution) for Agreement #C for Building #2
Construction total project cost $3,000,000.00

b) Reappoint/appoint the following to the board:

Dave Moyer - reappoint to new term to expire 01/01/2031

John Kerrick - reappoint to new term to expire 01/01/2031

iii) George Strunk - reappoint to new term to expire 01/01/2030

iv) Shawn Crawford - appoint term to expire 01/01/2031

i)
i)

c)

Acknowledge end of service on the board - Karl Weiler

Chairman Christy stated Karl Weiler has been a driving force on the airport board for many years
and has shown the benefits and needs for a municipal airport and the Commissioners thank him for his service.

Commissioner Laverdure also noted that the Pocono Mountains Regional Airport is important to
the community and brings many visitors into the county.

M-2025-313 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve the Capital Purchases Report dated 11/05/2025 as follows:

DEPARTMENT ACCOUNT # ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION QTY ITEM Vendor AMOUNT

APPROVED CAPITAL:

Emergency Management 101.4291.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 1 Pane\_s and canopy shefter for a Chery Industrial - Lowest Quote 5 5,599.00

shipping container

Courts 101.4184.7101.1100 Court Reporter Supplies | 1 |Office Furniture and Labor Office Service Company - State Contract 2,035.00
TOTAL APPROVED CAPITAL $ 7,634.00
REQUESTS WITH TRANSFER: (see Budget Adjustment Report)

Courts 101.4184.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 2 |Portable radios Motorola Solutions - State Confract 3 7,627.02
TOTAL REQUESTS W/ITRANSFER $ 7,627.02
GRANT FUNDED & OTHER:

RASA 177.4493 9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 2 |Heavy Duty Chairs Office Service Company - State Contract| $ 1,107.08
TOTAL GRANT FUNDED & OTHER $ 1,107.08
TOTAL CAPITAL REQUESTS | \ \ [s  16,368.10

M-2025-314 Motion by Commissioner Laverdure, seconded by Vice-Chairman Parker and
carried to approve the Computer Capital Purchases Report dated 11/05/2025 as follows:
DEPARTMENT ACCOUNT # ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION|QTY ITEM Vendor AMOUNT

APPROVED CAPITAL:

Correctional Facility 101.4172.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 1 | QBS tower GovConnection, Inc. - State Contract | $  1,198.51
Department Of Information Systems 101.4172.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 62 | County Computer Refresh Devices Dell - State Contract 74,190.40

101.4172.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 2 | Switches and accessories Iron Bow Tech - State Contact 11,935.38

TOTAL APPROVED CAPITAL $ 87,324.29
REQUESTS WITH TRANSFER: (see Budget Adjustment Report)

Correctional Facility 101.4232.5522.0000 Minor Equipment 1 |Document scanner CDW-G - State Contract $ 1,028.99
TOTAL REQUESTS W/ITRANSFER $ 1,028.99
GRANTFUNDED & OTHER:

Designated Funds: R&R 601.4153.8800.0000 Program Expenses 8 |Dell computers Dell - State Contract $ 792560
TOTAL GRANT FUNDED & OTHER $ 7,925.60
TOTAL CAPITAL REQUESTS [ [ [ §$96,278.88

Vice-Chairman Parker thanked the 24" Connecticut Militia Regiment and Pocono Township for
hosting the Reenactment. Vice-Chairman Parker also thanked Danny Younger for giving the historical
presentation about Connecticut’s claim to parts of Pennsylvania. Vice-Chairman Parker stated the group was



very complimentary of the citizens who attended the event. Vice-Chairman Parker also thanked the Veteran’s
Association for organizing the parade which the 24" Connecticut Militia Regiment also participated in.

Vice-Chairman Parker announced a save the date for Sunday, January 18, 2026,
when America250PA will be visiting Monroe County.

Commissioner Laverdure thanked everyone who participated in the Veteran’s Day parade.

Chairman Christy thanked the 40,265 Monroe County residents that came out to vote which was
a 34.8% turnout. Chairman Christy thanked Penny Robson and Sara May-Silfee for a job well done on the
election as well as all the department heads who gave up staff to help process the ballots. Chairman Christy also
congratulated all the winners and thanked everyone who dips their toe in the water for public service.

Joyce Onsted stated she has reliable reason to believe one or more employees of the courts are
providing ICE with advance information about foreign residents moving through the courts as well as residents
of Puerto Rico who are Americans. Ms. Onsted is asking for the assistance of the Commissioner’s to help
mitigate the situation. Ms. Onsted also asked if there had been any follow-up on the AOPC letter with respect
to local agencies and offices cooperating with ICE. Ms. Onsted also stated she would like to see the
Commissioners adopt a non-discrimination ordinance with respect to all employee conduct but especially the
court system employees.

Lauren Butler commented that she seconded everything Ms. Onsted stated.

Chairman Christy stated court employees are county employees, but they fall under the offices
of the courts. Chairman Christy recommended Ms. Onsted contact Cori Dougherty, Court Administrator with
any information she may have. Chairman Christy will provide Ms. Dougherty’s contact information to Ms.
Onstead.

Erik Deimer spoke on behalf of Go Collaborative and as Event Coordinator of the Annual Tree
Lighting. Mr. Deimer announced the event will take place on November 28, 2025, in Courthouse Square from
5:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m. and is free to attend.

Lauren Butler stated as a taxpayer she would like some clarity on the county’s policy on
cooperating with ICE as she is very nervous about lawsuits in the future. Ms. Butler also stated in reference to
Arc Map that it is the equivalent of the horse and buggy and Esri will be discontinuing support, and the county
will be at the mercy of whatever a company wants to charge. Ms. Butler recommended an immediate meeting
to address the GIS concerns as the Commissioners stated.

The meeting was adjourned at 10:21 a.m.

Robert J. Gress, Chief Clerk/Administrator

M-2025-299 through M-2025-314



