MONROE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS’ MEETING
March 4, 2020

The regular meeting of the Monroe County Board of Commissioners was held on Wednesday,
March 4, 2020, in the Commissioners’ Public Meeting Room, at the Monroe County Administrative
Center with the following present: Chairman Sharon S. Laverdure, Vice-Chairman John R. Moyer,
Commissioner John D. Christy, County Solicitor John B. Dunn, Chief Clerk/Administrator Greg Christine,
and Cindy King Administrative Secretary.

Chairman Laverdure called the meeting to order a 9:32 a.m. with a moment of silence and the
pledge of allegiance to the flag.

Chairman Laverdure asked if there was any public comment on agenda items. Former
Commissioner Suzanne McCool congratulated the recipients receiving the Woman’s Commission award
today. She stated that mental health and developmental services funding continues to decrease. We
need to urge the Governor and legislators to restore the funding that has been taken away. She
presented to the Commissioners a picture of her and former Commissioner Theresa Merli.

M-2020-79 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
approve the minutes of the 2/19/20 Commissioners’ Meeting, as presented.

M-2020-80 Motion by Vice-Chairman Moyer, seconded by Commissioner Christy, and carried to
approve the following:

1. Amend Motion M-2020-66 (Computer Capital) from the Commissioners’ Meeting on
February 5, 2020 to reflect the change in the purchase price for a new laser jet printer from
$1,019.27 to $1,196.03

2. Ratify the opening of the following bids on 2/20/20 for Security Renovations for MDJ Court —
98 Day Street:
a. JD Builders — No Bid
C.W. Grimm Construction - $14,588.00
CSl Integrated Security & Communications - No Bid
Bognet - $18,223.00
Richard Pierce Builder, Inc. — No Bid
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3. Ratify the opening of the following bids on 2/20/20 for Security Renovations for MDJ Court —
823A Ann Street:
a. JD Builders — No Bid
C.W. Grimm Construction - $15,884.00
CSl Integrated Security & Communications - No Bid
Bognet - $19,134.00
Richard Pierce Builder, Inc. — No Bid
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4. Award the Bid for the Moving of Voting Machines to Matheson Transfer Co., as follows:
a. Primary Election - $3,599.43
b. General Election - $3,599.43
Cost to move additional machines - $75.00 per machine
Cost for additional polling places - $150.00 per location

Chairman Laverdure welcomed Ms. Annette Atkinson, Chairman of the Monroe County
Woman's Commission, the Woman’s Commission celebrates Women’s History month each year by
honoring local women of accomplishment for their efforts assisting women to achieve their goals. This
year’s theme is “Valiant Women of the Vote”. The Woman’s Commission thanked the Commissioners
for their support.

The Commissioners presented certificates of special recognition to the following recipients:
Barbara Keiser, Martha Stout, Sara L. May-Silfee, Althea Staples, this posthumous award was accepted
by Amy Leiser.



Ms. Amy Leiser, Executive Director of Monroe County Historical Association, accepted the award
in memory of Althea Staples. Amy thanked the Commissioners and the Woman’s Commission. Althea
Staples was born in 1860 in Cherry Valley and was the descendant of Nicholas Depue the first European
settler in Monroe County in the 1720’s. In 1915 she became Chairman of the Woman’s Suffrage Society
of Monroe County. Amy gave a brief history of American History in 1915.

M-2020-81 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
adopt the certificates of special recognitions in honor of “Women’s History Month”.

The following Legislators presented citations to the woman receiving the “Woman’s Commission
Award”: Representative Jack Rader, Mackenzie Strunk on behalf of Representative Rosemary Brown,
Selina Winchester on behalf of Congresswoman Susan Wild, April Niver on behalf of Congressman Matt
Cartwright, and David Albright, Chestnuthill Township Manager.

M-2020-82 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
approve/ratify the following:

a) Personnel Agenda:



NAME: DEPT: POSITION: DATE: REASON:

NEW HIRES:

Jessica Kolment C&Y 33 Casw | 312720 Mew Hire, Replacement
Maxine Taorres C&Y 35 Casw 2 32120 MNew Hire, Replacement
Alice Carrion Aging 35 Care Manager 2 3/9/20 Mew Hire, Replacement
Brenda Montgomery Controller 11 Payroll Clk - PT 31920 MNew Hire, Replacement
Madelynn Adams Career Link Laborer 32120 MNew Hire

Kaylee Strunk Career Link Labarer 32120 Mew Hire

Letitia Lockwood Career Link Laborer 32120 Mew Hire

Michael Walsh Career Link Laborer 3220 MNew Hire

Alanna Thomas Career Link Labarer 32120 MNew Hire

Amber Neely Career Link Laborer 320 Mew Hire
SEPARATIONS:

Francis O'Boyle Assessment Auxiliary Bd Member 12/3119 Term Ended

Gisella Handelong Jail Cco 217720 Resigned

William Watkins PD 22 Asst PD - PT 3131720 Resigned

Jason Leon PD 22 Asst PD - PT 3/31/20 Resigned

Joan Burrowbridge Sheniff 8 Personal Prop Clk 226720 Retired

Lorinda Homar-Gordon WA 6 Office Asst PT 2120720 Terminated

CHANGES:

Stephanie Shaffer Aging 36 Casw I 4/7-6/29/20 LOA

Stephanie Shaffer Aging 35 Casw Il 6/30/20 LOA

Misbah Khan C&Y 2T S5A3FT 31720 Promotion

Michelle Micholas Courts 18 Court Reporter 2M8-3M17720 LOA

Rebecca Frederick Emerg Serv 9 Acct Tech 1/1/20 Reclassification
Jacqueline Genest Fiscal 13 Specialist 2M18-3/3720 RTW Reduce Sch 3 hriwk
Jacgueline Genest Fiscal 13 Specialist 34-3M7120 RTW Reduce Sch & hriwk
Pamela Thomas-McDougle HR 10 Adm Sec 313720 Extend Prob 2 months
Sheri Haley HR. 14 HR Asst 3M19-4/2/20 LOA,

Arkadiusz Martynowicz Jail Call 1/23-3/20/20 Extend Modified Duty
Mark Maminski Jail col 1/6-2/25/20 Extend LOA

Elizabeth Knight Jail { MCCF) Coll 2/25-3/23/20 Extend Modified Duty
Robert Schwartz Jail (MCCF) Coll 2/28-312/20 Extend Modified Duty
Mark Maminski Jail (Vot Reg) coll 2/26-3/6/20 RTW Modified Duty
Roderick Burns Maint 3 Custodian 3/23/20 Probation Complete
Teresa Madej IMaint 3 Custodian G3 2/29-3/26/20 Extend LOA

Teresa Madej Maint 3 Custodian G3 3127416120 LOA

Jill Kozic MDJ Riley 10 Adv Tech 2M18-5M12/20 Adjust LOA dates
David Skutnik PD 22 Asst PD 1113720 Transfer from PT to FT
Mina Trubiano Proth 10 Deputy 3M1-3/31720 Extend LOA

Angela Bremer Proth 11 Dep Proth 2/28/20 RTW Full Duty

Helen Lentz Prath 8 Proth Rec Tech 2M18-5M17/20 LOA Intermittent
James Juarbe Voter Reg 8 Records Tech 2124120 Transfer from Proth

MISCELLANEOUS:

Request from Tom Stone, Operations & Maint. Superintendent to hire a full-time 3 Custodian for the 701 Main

Street building

Delete the 8 Office Assistant Sr at Emergency Senices, replace it with a 9 Accounting Technician and adopt
the job description retro-active to January 2, 2020

Prothonotary George Warden will transfer one 8 Records Tech position from the Prothonotary office to the Clerk

of Courts office

b) Requests to work additional hours:

i) Elections:
(1) Up to one hour per day from 3/2/20 to 4/28/20 for Kathy Cesare, Mary Dunkleberger,
Penny Robson, James Juarbe
ii)  Sheriff’s Office Overtime Report for the period ending 2/16/20:
(1) Deputies—114.25 hours
(2) Clerks—78.48 hours
(3) Security —56.50 hours

M-2020-83 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
approve the following:



a) Vouchers Payable:
i) $760,527.50 for the week ending 2/21/20
ii) $599,821.89 for the week ending 2/28/20
b) Gross Payroll:
i) $1,199,283.99 for the period ending 2/16/20
¢) Healthcare Benefits Payments:
i) Highmark Blue Cross/Blue Shield:
(1)$51,265.38 on 2/19/20
(2)$54,501.95 on 2/26/20
i) Geisinger:
(1)$255,072.20 on 2/18/20
(2)$103,999.45 on 2/25/20
iii) Dental Claims:
(1)$6,213.03 on 2/21/20
(2)$1,311.20 (Admin Fees)
(3)$4,505.38 on 2/28/20
iv) ConnectYourCare:
(1)$1,423.10 on 2/21/20
(2)S3,468.89 on 2/28/20

M-2020-84 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
approve/ratify the following travel requests and the attached Travel Request Report:

a) Planning Department:
i) Christine Meinhart to Pittston, PA to attend the 2020 monthly meetings of the Northeast
Pennsylvania Alliance
b) Penn State Extension:
i) Sherri Williams to Bloomsburg, PA on 3/31/20 to attend the 4-H STEM Training
¢) Travel Request Report — Probation, Children & Youth, Conservation District, District Attorney,
Emergency Services, Planning and Sheriff’s Office

M-2020-85 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded by Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to
execute an agreement with Active Aging, Inc. to provide consulting services to the agency at the rate of
$60.00 per hour, as requested by the Area Agency on Aging.

M-2020-86 Motion by Vice-Chairman Moyer, seconded by Commissioner Christy and carried to
execute the following Subsidy Agreements for Permeant Legal Custodian, as requested by Children and
Youth Services:

i) M.S.
i) J.S.

M-2020-87 Motion by Vice-Chairman Moyer, seconded by Commissioner Christy and carried to
approve the following:

a) Ratify the Budget Adjustment Report dated 2/26/20 totaling $24,525.00

b) The Budget Adjustment Report dated 2/26/20 totaling $172,261.00

c) Ratify the Chief Clerk to advertise the Notice of Request for Funding Proposal Applications
for the 2020 Emergency Solutions Grant

d) The use of Courthouse Square by the African-American Network on 6/13/20 from 1:00 p.m.
to 7:00 p.m.

e) Execute the following documents for the Courthouse Expansion Project:
i) Confidentiality Agreement with PNC Bank
ii) Proposal for Professional Valuation Services with Real Estate Appraisal & Marketing

Associates in the amount of $2,500.00

f) Acknowledge receipt of the 2019 Information Services Annual Report

g) Execute a Contract Service Provider Agreement with Ashley Messoline, Esquire to act as a
Special Public Defender in conflict cases

h) Execute a Social Hall Rental Agreement with the Shawnee Fire Company in the amount of
$250.00, to use their facility as a polling site on April 28, 2020 for the 2020 Primary Election
and November 3, 2020 for the 2020 General Election

i) Execute a Commonwealth of Pennsylvania Multi-Party Geospatial Data-Sharing Agreement
to allow the Commonwealth of PA to access select data-sets from the County GIS System
j) Execute an Agreement with Borton Lawson Engineering in the amount of $17,000.00 to

provide professional engineering services in 2020 for the county bridges
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k)

Interior Renovations to Court Room Six Project as follows:
i) Change door to fire rated

i)

Relocate HVAC Condensate Pump

iii) Install new HVAC Diffusers

I) Award the bids for Security Renovations for the following MDJ Courts:
i) 98 Day Street — MDJ Muth

(1) C.W. Grimm Construction - $14,588.00
ii)823A Ann Street — MDJ Anzini

(1) C.W. Grimm Construction - $15,884.00

i) 1D Badges Unlimited, Inc. — Sheriff
ii) Michele M. Horn-Aisberge — PD

iii) William H. Lane, Inc. - Commissioners

Add the following Vendors to the County List of Approved Vendors:

Change Order Number One (1) with Grimm Construction in the amount of $1,202.00 for the

M-2020-88 Motion by Commissioner Christy, seconded Vice-Chairman Moyer and carried to

appoint Robert Deinarowicz, Jr., to the Pocono Mountains Municipal Airport Authority Board of

Directors, replacing Frank Revitt, with a term to expire 1/31/25

M-2020-89 Motion by Vice-Chairman Moyer, seconded by Commissioner Christy and carried to
ratify/approve the following Capital Purchases Reports:

DEPARTMENT ACCOUNT # ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION |QTY ITEM Vendor AMOUNT

APPROVED CAPITAL:

Sheriff 101.4197.7109.0000 Uniforms 2 |Bullet Proof Vests Starr Uniform-Sole Source 1,700.00
Sig Sauer P320 9mms, tactical

Sheriff 101.4197.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 2 |weapons lights, and holsters, including| Atlantic Tactical-Lowest Quote 1,370.34
shipping & handling

TOTAL APPROVED CAPITAL $  3,070.34

REQUESTS WITH TRANSFER: (see Budget Adjustment Report)

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.95750000 | Capital Expenditure 1 |Storage Cabinet, 3-drawer Lateral o o0 contract 1116.50
File Cabinet and Laminate Top

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 1 |Aluminum Blinds & installation Office Service Co.-State Contract 2,265.04

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 11 |Tables Office Service Co.-State Confract 3,897.75

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 36 |Side Chairs Office Service Co -State Confract 3,565.80

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 4 |Storage Cabinets & Bookcases Office Service Co.-State Confract 3,829.08

Pre-Trial Services 1014240 95750000  |Capital Expenditure 5 E:’j'r‘;':;‘n‘! drawers, pedestalfiles | g0 sonice Co-State Contract 3,967.09

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 5 |Task Chairs Office Service Co.-State Confract 2,049.05

Pre-Trial Services 101.4240.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 2 |Mead Board and Dry Erase Board Office Service Co -State Confract 334.05

TOTAL REQUESTS WITRANSFER $  21,024.36

GRANT FUNDED & OTHER:

TOTAL GRANT FUNDED & OTHER $

TOTAL CAPITAL REQUESTS | [§ 24,00470

DEPARTMENT ACCOUNT # ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION |QTY ITEM Vendor AMOUNT

APPROVED CAPITAL:

Emergency Management 101.4291.9575.0000 Capital Expenditure 1 | Fuel Control Station Upgrade KFT-Sole Source 21,260.00

TOTAL APPROVED CAPITAL $ 21,260.00

REQUESTS WITH TRANSFER: (see Budget Adjustment Report)

Domestic Relations 157.4187.5522.0000 Minor Equipment 1 ?;ggback Mesh Chair with adjustable Office Service Co.-State Contract 32522

Voter Registration 101.4120.5522.0000  |Minor Equipment 1 ;‘r‘fﬂl’b“k Mesh Chair with adjustable | e o sonice Co -State Gontract 32522

TOTAL REQUESTS W/ITRANSFER $ 650.44

GRANT FUNDED & OTHER:

Children & Youth 751 Various 7950.0410 | Purchased Assets g |fescald-drawer Flle Cabets Wit jon state Contract 524.30

TOTAL GRANT FUNDED & OTHER $ 524.30

TOTAL CAPITAL REQUESTS | [§ 2243474

M-2020- 90 Motion by Vice-Chairman Moyer, seconded by Commissioner Christy and carried to
approve the Computer Capital Purchases Report dated as follows:




DEPARTMENT

ACCOUNT #

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION

ITEM

Vendor

AMOUNT

APPROVED CAPITAL.:

TOTAL APPROVED CAPITAL $0.00
REQUESTS WITH TRANSFER: (see Budget Adjustment Report)
TOTAL REQUESTS W/ITRANSFER $0.00
GRANT FUNDED & OTHER:
Polycom RealPresence Deskiop
DUI Central Processing 159.4000.8800.0000 Program Expenses 1 |for Windows, HP LaserJet Pro  [SHI-Lowest Quote $458.42
Printer and Webcam
Public Liability 250 5700.8800.0001  |Grant Expenses 1 ﬁ:;‘ﬂ?ﬂ':'o”'m“ Wiring & Vmax-Sole Source $650.00
Prothonotary 601.4195.8800.0000 Program Expenses 1 _|Dell Latitude 3500 Laptop Dell-State Contract $845.40
TOTAL GRANT FUNDED & OTHER 1,953.82
TOTAL CAPITALREQUESTS | [ [ $1953.82

Chairman Laverdure reported that the Commissioners had a conference call this morning with

Department of Health regarding the coronavirus (COVID-19) and to date there has been nothing

reported at this time. Commissioner Christy stated if you are visiting elderly facility take extreme caution
as they most acceptable population. For updates on the virus go to Healthpa.gov and World Health

organization websites.

Chairman Laverdure asked if there was any public comment. Suzanne McCool had a question on
an agenda item. Clarification was given.

Chairman Laverdure adjourned the meeting at 10:15 a.m.

M-2020-79 thru M-2020-90

Greg Christine, Chief Clerk/Administrator




TRAVEL REQUEST REPORT

Travel ID

!Trave! Date(s)

|Trave|er(s)

|Destination |Purpose of Travel | Est. Costs
ADULT PROBATION
2020-0046 [05/29/2020 -- 05/29/2020 |Dunlap, Opal ESU Innovation To attend The Ripple Effect $3.42
Center, 562 Trauma Training on May 29,
Independence 2020.
Road, East
Stroudsburg, PA
18301
CHILDREN & YOUTH SERVICES
2020-0056 (03/16/2020 -- 03/20/2020 |Grace, Adelaide Mechanicsburg Attend Leadership Roundtable | $1,081.50
and State College |(Mechanicsburg) and PCYA
Quarterly Board and
Membership Meetings (State
College)
2020-0061 |03/18/2020 -- 03/20/2020 |Howard, Anne Nitty Lion Inn, To attend the PCYA quarterly $619.00
State College, PA |meeting
16803
CONSERVATION DISTRICT
2020-0068 [04/09/2020 -- 04/09/2020 |Andrea Polkowski Scranton, PA 2020 Northeast PA Regional $0.00
Watershed Group Workshop
DISTRICT ATTORNEY
2020-0059 (03/23/2020 -- 03/27/2020 |Bentzoni, Wendy Dallas Texas CellHawk, by Hawk Analytics, is| $4,175.00
Webbe, Brian a web-based investigative
software product that we use to
plot location data from cell
phone and other records. We
purchased a subscription to
CellHawk several months ago
and it has already proven its
investigative usefulness.
The software is quite robust,
and while we’ve used it
numerous times over the last
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2020-0059 (03/23/2020 -- 03/27/2020

TRAVEL REQUEST REPORT

Dallas Texas

few months, we're barely
scratching the surface of its
capabilities.

Hawk Analytics offers an
intensive 5-day training class
which teaches not only the
features of the CellHawk
program itself, but an in-depth
review of cellular telephone
networks, the data capture
during cellular activity, and how
to leverage that data for
investigations and prosecutions.

We would like Wendy Serfass
and Brian Webbe attend the
March class, scheduled for
March 23 through 27, in Dallas,
Texas. This class, priced at
$795 per student, is the last
class to be offered at that price
point. All classes afterwards
will be $995 per student.

Further, after the upcoming
March class, there are no
scheduled sessions until early
May, to be held in Phoenix,
Arizona; and then a class in
August in Detroit, Michigan.

As CellHawk is a proprietary
software product, Hawk
Analytics is the only vendor who
offers this training.

$4,175.00
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TRAVEL REQUEST REPORT

Philadelphia Pike
Bethlehem, PA
18015

2020-0059 [03/23/2020 -- 03/27/2020 Dallas Texas In addition to the cost of the $4,175.00
class, we would need to cover
travel and hotel
accommodations.
There is money in the Digital
Forensics account to cover
these costs.
EMERGENCY SERVICES
2020-0064 (04/21/2020 -- 04/22/2020 |Harrison, Bradley PEMA Attend L - 146 Homeland $229.60
Headquarters, Security Exercise Evlauation
1310 Elmerton Program (HSEEP)
Avenue,
Harrisburg, PA
17110
2020-0065 [04/15/2020 -- 04/16/2020 |Harrison, Bradley Susquehanna Attend G271 - Hazardous $22.00
County Office, 81 |Weather and Flooding
Public Avenue, Preparedness
Montrose, PA
18801
OFFICE OF THE SHERIFF
2020-0063 [03/23/2020 -- 04/03/2020 |Soltan, Martin Penn State Driving to Penn State University $716.00
University, Main for Civil Process training.
Campus Deputy Soltan will be making
this trip 4 times in his own
vehicle.
PLANNING
2020-0067 (02/27/2020 -- 02/27/2020 |Ryan Hill 3700 Old The Water Quality Data $25.30

Workshop
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